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January 5, 1999

Live Oak, Florida

9:00 a.m.


The Suwannee County Board of County Commissioners met on the above date and time for a regular session and the following were present: Chairman Jerry Scott; Commissioner Douglas M. Udell; Commissioner Robert Taylor; Commissioner Donald M. Odom, Sr.; and Commissioner Barry Baker; and Mike Tyson and Eric Musgrove, Deputy Clerks.  Also present was Hal A. Airth, County Attorney.


Chairman Scott called the meeting to order at 9:02 a.m., and called Ray Brown, Public Works Director, to lead the invocation followed by the pledge of allegiance to the flag.


The first item on the agenda was to call for additional agenda items.  There was one listed additional agenda item:

1) Commissioner Odom asked to speak about the old library building in Branford.

Chairman Scott called for further additional items.  There were none.  Commissioner Odom then motioned to add these aforementioned items to the agenda under item number 10, Additional Agenda Items.  Commissioner Baker seconded, and the motion carried unanimously.

The second item on the agenda was to consider approval of minutes of meetings held on November 17 and November 24, 1998.  Commissioner Udell moved to approve the minutes.  Commissioner Odom seconded, and the motion carried unanimously.

The third item on the agenda was a presentation by Merry Taylor, County Extension Director, and Philip Petaway, Small Farms Management Specialist, regarding the  annual report of the Extension Office programs.

Ms. Taylor came to the podium and gave her report of the Extension Office programs.  Ms. Taylor spoke of horticultural, nutritional, family, divorce, marriage, and leadership programs within her office.  Ms. Taylor then introduced Philip Petaway, Small Farms Management Specialist.

Mr. Petaway gave a copy of his report to each commissioner and spoke about it.  There were several items that he discussed, including farm assistance, education and training, promotional ads, financial loans, conservation, cooperatives, and objectives.

The fourth item on the agenda was a request by Merry Taylor, County Extension Director, for proportionate funding for an Agriculture Marketing position.

Ms. Taylor gave a copy of her request describing the Agriculture Marketing position to the commissioners.  Ms. Taylor then went into further detail with the position.  Commissioner Udell asked for clarification on the amount of money the County would provide.  Commissioner Udell suggested waiting until the next meeting so that he could read the report given by Ms. Taylor.

Commissioner Udell left the meeting at 9:35 a.m.

Ms. Taylor described the current leadership positions and answered further questions about the proposed position.

Commissioner Udell returned to the meeting at 9:37 a.m.

Commissioner Baker left the meeting at 9:37 a.m.

Commissioner Baker returned to the meeting at 9:38 a.m.

There were questions concerning funding from other counties within the multi-county area.  Ms. Taylor stated that she would return to the next regular Board meeting, after the commissioners had been able to read her full proposal.

The fifth item on the agenda was a request by Daniel R. Sivyer, Fire Coordinator, that the following property be declared surplus:  1990 Ford Taurus.  Commissioner Baker was asked to present the proposal in the absence of Mr. Sivyer due to a call-out.  Commissioner Baker stated that the car was the one discussed in a previous meeting.

After further discussion about the vehicle between Greg Scott, Recreation Director, and Mr. Sivyer, Commissioner Odom motioned to make the car surplus, and Commissioner Udell seconded.  The motion carried unanimously.

At 9:43 a.m., Chairman Scott called a break until 10:00 a.m.

January 5, 1999

Live Oak, Florida

10:03 a.m.


Chairman Scott called the meeting back to order.

The sixth item on the agenda was to open bids for the marking of center lines within right-of-way for 75 miles of roads.  Jean Fieler, Deputy Clerk Records Supervisor, read the bids.

The first bid was from Ozark Striping Company, Inc, of Ozark, Alabama.  They were unable to submit a bid.

The second bid was from Jenkins Painting, Inc., of Chiefland, Florida.

For Skip Line (Paint):



$10,125.00

For Solid Line (Paint):


$17,625.00

For Right of Way Stripe (Paint):

$17,625.00

Grand Total for Paint:



$45,375.00

For Skip Line (Thermoplastic):

$31,875.00

For Solid Line (Thermoplastic):

$80,625.00

For Right of Way Stripe (Thermoplastic):
$73,125.00

Grand Total for Thermoplastic:

$185,625.00

The third bid was from Florida Striping, Inc., of Melbourne, Florida. 

For Skip Line (Paint):



$11,250.00

For Solid Line (Paint):


$24,000.00

For Right of Way Stripe (Paint):

$24,000.00

Grand Total for Paint:



$59,250.00

For Skip Line (Thermoplastic):

No Bid

For Solid Line (Thermoplastic):

No Bid

For Right of Way Stripe (Thermoplastic):
No Bid

Grand Total for Thermoplastic:

No Bid

Ed Harvey, Budget Officer, presented last year’s prices for striping the same amount, whose total was $44,400.00.  There was discussion about the budgeted amount for painting.

Commissioner Udell motioned to table the issue until Mr. Brown could look at the bids.  Commissioner Taylor seconded, and the motion carried unanimously.

The seventh item on the agenda was to consider adoption of resolutions to amend the following budgets for Fiscal Year 1997-1998:

a) Criminal Justice Trust

b) Debt Service Fund

c) Fire Protection

Ed Harvey, Budget Officer, came to the podium and described the proposed resolutions.

Commissioner Baker motioned to adopt the resolutions.  Commissioner Udell seconded, and the motion carried unanimously.  (See Resolutions No. 99-19, 99-20, and 99-21)

The eighth item on the agenda was a discussion by Randy Henderson, Clerk of Court, about invoices paid by the Board to the Clerk.  Mr. Henderson asked that this item be stricken from the agenda.

The ninth item on the agenda was for Jerry Scott, Chairman of the Board, to make appointments to committees for 1999.  Chairman Scott read out the 1999 Committees as he had appointed.  (See attached list)

Commissioner Baker motioned to approve the committee appointments.  Commissioner Taylor seconded, and the motion carried unanimously.

The tenth item on the agenda additional agenda items.  There was one additional agenda items.

1) Discussion of the old Branford library.

Commissioner Odom stated that the library was already in two major portions, with the health department in one portion.  Commissioner Odom suggested using the other portion as an extension office for Sheriff Al Williams and his deputies.

Sheriff Williams stated that it was in the County’s interest to establish an extension office in Branford to foster cooperation between the towns of the county.  The old library would also allow private conversations to be carried out between deputies and citizens, which was lacking in their present office in the Branford Town Hall.

Commissioner Odom motioned to provide the south part of the old Branford Library as a Sheriff’s Department extension office and proceed with the renovations to make it usable by the Sheriff’s Department.  Commissioner Taylor seconded the motion, and after further discussion, it carried unanimously.

The eleventh item on the agenda was staff reports.

Ed Harvey, County Coordinator, expressed his appreciation to the Board for choosing him for the position of County Coordinator.

Ray Brown, Public Works Director, was not present.  Commissioner Odom stated that the new excavator recently purchased would be demonstrated at 1:00 p.m. on January 5, 1999, if anyone would like to watch.

John D. Hales, Jr., Director of Libraries, spoke about applications about a position with the new Branford Library.  Mr. Hales stated there had been a problem with water pipes to the library in Live Oak freezing during the cold weather.  He advised that Internet connections in all eight libraries in Suwannee, Madison, and Hamilton Counties were up and running.  Mr. Hales stated that Hamilton County is looking into building or buying a new library in Jennings.  He also discussed a proposed meeting with area Senator Richard Mitchell to address concerns.  Mr. Hales also stated that Friday, January 8, 1999, there would be a meeting at the new Branford Library with its contractors and architects to discuss certain minor concerns.

Hal A. Airth, County Attorney, had nothing to report.

Randy Henderson, Clerk of the Circuit Court, was not present.

Alton K. Williams, Jr., Sheriff, had already spoken.

Greg Scott, Recreation Director, was not present.

The twelfth item on the agenda was public comments.  There were none.

The thirteenth item on the agenda was to consider payment of invoices.  Commissioner Udell motioned to approve batches 99-0129 – 99-154, for a total of $1,909,304.74.  Commissioner Odom seconded, and the motion carried unanimously.

SUWANNEE COUNTY

BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
WARRANTS ISSUED REPORT

TO BE APPROVED ON 01-05-98






FUND


AMOUNT






1
GENERAL FUND
$
635,744.95

112
HOSPITAL INVESTMENT
$
-

116
FINE AND FORFEITURE
$
427,297.82

118
STATE ATTORNEY'S OFFICE
$
7,270.51

119
MUNICIPAL SERVICES FUND
$
17,930.05

120
LAW ENFORCEMENT
$
720.22

121
NARCOTICS CONTROL
$
15,862.26

122
FIRE PROTECTION FUND
$
16,682.37

126
EMS GRANT FUND
$
-

128
EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT GRANT
$
-

129
LAW EDUCATION
$
1,438.86

131
TOURIST DEVELOPMENT
$
20.87

140
ROAD AND BRIDGE
$
336,438.91

159
SOLID WASTE MANAGEMENT GRANT
$
-

171
LIBRARY FUND
$
82,870.03

172
RECREATION FUND
$
11,461.85

181
LOCAL HOUSING ASSISTANCE PROGRAM
$
17,764.31

191
CRIMINAL JUSTICE TRUST
$
-

251
RENNOVATIONS/DEBT SERVICE FUND
$
43.54

205
AIRPORT IMPROVEMENT
$
-

351
RENNOVATIONS/CONST. FUND
$
33.17

371
STATE GRANT-LIBRARY CONSTRUCTION
$
-

402
SOLID WASTE COLLECTION
$
104,298.77

403
SOLID WASTE DISPOSAL
$
233,426.25


BATCHES 99-0129 - 154




GRAND TOTAL
$
1,909,304.74

The fourteenth item on the agenda was to consider other business.  There was none.  Chairman Scott thanked George Fuller for manning the video camera.

Commissioner Udell motioned to adjourn the meeting and Commissioner Odom seconded.

Commissioner Taylor stated that he had visited the area stricken by a tornado recently and the citizens wished to thank the Sheriff’s Department and others for their help.  The motion to adjourn carried unanimously.

There being no further business to discuss, the Board adjourned at 10:40 a.m.

___________________________

JERRY SCOTT, CHAIRMAN

SUWANNEE COUNTY BOARD

OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

ATTEST:

_______________________

W. RANDY HENDERSON,

CLERK OF CIRCUIT COURT
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